
Clerk of Courts: IFB 2017-020 

Bid Tabulation Report - Cisco Switch Edge Project Bidder 1 Bidder 2 'Bidder 3 

Bid Close Date: Monday, September 18, 2017@ 3:00 P.M. EST CDW-G Zones Total Communications 
Service Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total 

Item DESCRIPTION Part Number Duration QTY Price Price Price Price Price Price 

** UNIT PRICES LEFT BLANK ARE DEEMED NO BID BY THE VENDOR** 

1. 
, Catalyst 9300 48-port PoE+, Network 

C9300-48P-E IN/A 14 4,352.87 60,940.18 5,437.15 76,120.10 5,440.50 76,167.00 
Essentials t ' 

2. 
SNTC-8X5XNBD Catalyst 9300 48-port 

CON-SNT-C93004PE I 36.0 month(s) 14 1,388.00I 19,432.00 1,267.09 17,739.26 1,276.48 17,870.72 
PoE+, Network Esse 

3. Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term Cl-ISE-BASE-T N/A 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

4. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y I Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
- -

5. 
Cisco ONE C9300 DNA Essentials 48-

Port Term licenses 
Cl-C9300-48-DNAE-T N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

6. Cisco ONE Subscription SKU 3Y Cl-C9300-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
L 

7. Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term Cl-ISE-BASE-T N/A 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

8. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
-

9. Catalyst Stack Power Cable 30 CM CAB-SPWR-30CM N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

10. 50CM Type 1 Stacking Cable STACK-Tl-50CM N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

11. North America AC Type A Power Cable CAB-TA-NA N/A 28 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

12. 715W AC Config 1 Power Supply PWR-Cl-715WAC N/A 14 585.06 8,190.84 0.00 0.00 0.00 
-+- - .j 

I 

13. CAT9300 Universal Image I S9300UK9-165 N/A 14 0.00 0.00
1 

0.00 0.00 0.00 

14. 
C9300 Network Essentia Is, 48-port 

C9300-NW-E-48 N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
license 

15. 
715W AC Config 1 Secondary Power 

Supply 
PWR-Cl-715WAC/2 N/A 14 0.00 0.00 655.20 9,172.80 731.25 10,237.50 

16. Catalyst 9300 8 x lOGE Network Module C9300-NM-8X N/A 14 1,170.13 16,381.82 1,461.60 20,462.40 1,462.50 20,475.00 

17. 
Cisco ONE Essentials Term, C9300 48-

C1E1TCAT93002 N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
port 
Cl Essentials Term C9300 48P 3Y - DNA, I 

18. 
2 

C1E1TCAT93002-3Y 36.0 month(s) 14 554.64 7,764.96 692.80 9,699.20 693.23 9,705.22 
5 ISE Base 

19. 
Cisco ONE Essential Add-On Term, 

C9300 
ClEA1TCAT93001 N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

20. 
Cl Essentials Add-On Term C9300 3Y -

36.0 month(s) 
25 ISE Base 

ClEA1TCAT93001-3Y 14 39.78 556.92 49.69 695.66 49.73 696.22 

21. 
Catalyst 9300 24-port PoE+, Network 

Essentials 
C9300-24P-E N/A 3 2,527.47 7,582.41 3,157.06 9,471.18 3,159.00 9,477.00 

AWARDED
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22. 
: SNTC-8X5XNBD Catalyst 9300 24-port 

CON-SNT-C93002PE ' 36.0 month(s) 3 805.00 2,415.00 735.17 2,205.51 740.78 2,222.34 
PoE+, Network Esse 

1 Cisco ONE C9300 DNA Essentials 24-
r N/A 

! 

23. 
Port Term licenses 

Cl-C9300-24-DNAE-T 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

24. Cisco ONE Subscription SKU 3Y Cl-C9300-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

25. Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term Cl-ISE-BASE-T N/A 75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

26. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

27. Catalyst Stack Power Cable 30 CM CAB-SPWR-30CM IN/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

28. >50CM Type 1 Stacking Cable STACK-Tl-50CM N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

29. North America AC Type A Power Cable CAB-TA-NA N/A 6 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

30. 715W AC Config 1 Power Supply PWR-Cl-715WAC N/A 3 585.06 1,755.18 0.00 0.00 731.25 2,193.75 

31. CAT9300 Universal Image S9300UK9-165 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

32. 
C9300 Network Essentials, 24-port 

C9300-NW-E-24 N/A 3 
license 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

33. 
715W AC Config 1 Secondary Power 

PWR-Cl-715WAC/2 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 655.20 1,965.60 0.00 
Supply 

I 

l 

34. Catalyst 9300 8 x lOGE Network Module C9300-NM-8X N/A 3 1,170.13 3,510.39 1,461.60 4,384.80 1,462.50 4,387.50 
I 

35. 
Cisco ONE Essentials Term, C9300 24-

C1E1TCAT93001 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
port 

36. 
Cl Essentials Term C9300 24P 3Y - DNA, 

25 ISE Base C1E1TCAT93001-3Y 36.0 month(s) 3 320.61 961.83 400.48 1,201.44 400.73 1,202.19 

37. Cisco ISE Device Admin License L-ISE-TACACS= N/A 1 1,872.20 1,872.20 2,338.56 2,338.56 2,340.00 2,340.00 
-

38. 
Cisco Identity Services Engine 500 

L-ISE-BSE-500= N/A 1 1,170.13 1,170.13 1,181.63 1,181.63 1,462.50 1,462.50 
EndPoint Base License 

39. 
Cisco ISE 100 Endpoint Plus Subscription 

License 
L-ISE-PLS-S-100= N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 965.25 965.25 

40. Cisco ISE 3-Yr 100 Endpoint Plus License ISE-PLS-3YR-100 36.0 month(s) 1 772.28 772.28 964.66 964.66 0.00 
+ 

41. 
Cisco ISE 100 Endpoint Apex 

L-ISE-APX-S-100= N/A 1 
Subscription License 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

42. 
Cisco ISE 3-Yr 100 Endpoint Apex 

License 
ISE-APX-3YR-100 36.0 month(s) 1 585.06 585.06 730.80 730.80 731.25 731.25 



Clerk of Courts: IFB 2017-020 

Bid Tabulation Report - Cisco Switch Edge Project Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 

Bid Close Date: Monday, September 18, 2017@ 3:00 P.M. EST CDW-G Zones Total Communications 

Service Unit l Total Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total 

Item DESCRIPTION Part Number Duration QTY Price Price Price Price Price Price 
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43. 
Cisco Identity Services Engine VM 

R-ISE-VM-K9= N/A 3 2,803.62 8,410.86 3,193.46 9,S80.38 3,S04.1S 10,S12.4S 
(eDelivery) -

i SWSS UPGRADES Cisco Identity Services I I 

44. . CON-ECMU-ISEVM 36.0 month(s) 3 2,839.00 8,s17.00 1 2,S90.39 7,771.17 2,610.14 7,830.42 
Engine VM (eDelivery) 

4S. 
lOGBASE-LR SFP Module, Enterprise-

SFP-lOG-LR-S= N/A 10 889.30 8,893.00 1,110.82 11,108.20 1,111.SO 11,llS.OO 
Class 

46. 
lOGBASE-SR SFP Module, Enterprise-

I SFP-lOG-SR-S= N/A 8 
Class 

304.23 2,433.84 380.02 3,040.16 380.2S 3,042.00 

47. 
802.llac W2 AP w/CA; 4x4 :3; Int Ant; 

2xGbE B 
AIR-AP28021-B-K9 1N/A 24 606.12 14,S46.88 678.79 16,290.96 7S7.58 18,181.92 

48. 
SNTC-8XSXNBD 802.llac W2 AP w/CA; 

CON-SNT-AIRAPIKB 36.0 month(s) 24 123.00 2,9S2.00 112.44 2,698.S6 113.00 2,712.00 

- 3x4:3; Int A~t; 2~G 

49. 
Ceiling Grid Clip for Aironet APs -

AIR-AP-T-RAIL-R N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
~Recessed Mount (Default) 

~ 

so. 
802.lln AP Low Profile Mounting 

AIR-AP-BRACKET-1 N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
Bracket (Defaul!) i-
Cisco Aironet 2800 Series CAPWAP 

Sl. 
Software Image 

SW2802-CAPWAP-K9 N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

S2. Cisco ONE - 3S04 Wireless Controller Cl-AIR-CT3504-K9 N/A 3 2,340.2S 7,020.7S 2,923.20 8,769.60 2,92S.OO 8,77S.OO 

S3. 
SNTC-8XSXNBD Cisco ONE - 3S04 

, Wireless Controller 
CON-SNT-C19AIRKC 36.0 month(s) 3 1,S40.00 4,620.00 1,40S.47 4,216.41 1,416.19 4,248.57 

S4. AC Power Cord, Type CS, US, Canada CAB-AC-CS N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

SS. 
Cisco 3S04 Wireless Controller DTLS 

License 
LIC-CT3S04-DTLS-K9 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

S6. 
Cisco 3S04 Wireless Controller SW Rel. 

8.5 
AIR-CT3S04-SW-8.S N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

- - ' 
S7. 

Cisco 3S04 Wireless Controller Power 

t Supply 
PWR-llSW-AC N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

S8. 
3S04 Wireless Controller Rack Mount 

Tray 
AIR-CT3S04-RMNT N/A 3 lOS.31 31S.93 I 131.63 394.89 

S9. 
Cisco ONE Foundation Perpetual -

C1FPAIRK9 N/A 3 
Wireless 

163.82 491.46 131.S4 394.62 204.7S 614.2S 

60. 
SWSS UPGRADES Cl Foundation 

Perpetual - Wireless 
CON-ECMU-ClFPAIR 36.0 month(s) 3 12S.OO 37S.OO 114.60 343.80 llS.47 346.41 

61 . 
Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

License (any WLC) 
Cl-WLC-1 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

62. 
Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

License PAK (any WLC) 
Cl-WLC-PAK N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

63 . 
Cisco ONE Pl Device License for LF & AS 

for WLAN 
Cl-Pl-LFAS-AP-K9 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
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Cisco ONE Identity Services Engine 25 
I 

64. Cl-I SE-BASE-AP IN/A 3 0.00 o.oo : 0.00 1 0.00 0.00 
EndPoint Base Lie 

Iosco ONE-CMX OnPrem Base (Location 
I I ~ 

65. Cl-MSE-LS-1 1
N/A 3 0.00 0.00 1 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

+Connect) - lAP licen_se 
t l 66. 

Cisco ONE Energy Mgmt Perpetual Lie -
Cl-CEM-25-K9 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

25 DO End Points 

t 
67. Cisco ONE StealthWatch 5 FPS Lie 1 YR ICl-LC-5-lY IN/A I 3 0.00 , 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

.,. 
T 

68. 1 Tracker PIO v03 Fnd Perpetual AIR - no 
IClFlVAIR-03 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

delivery 

Cisco ONE Access - Wireless - CHOOSE I 

69. N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 
I 0.00 Cl-AIR-K9 1 I 0.00 I ONLY QTY 1 HERE 

r I 

0.00
1 70. SWSS UPGRADES Cisco ONE - Wireless CON-ECMU-ClAIRK 36.0 month(s) 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

r l 
71. Cisco ONE MSE License PAK Cl-MSE-PAK N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

j -
72. 

I 
Tracker Eligibility SKU for DNA Offers I DNA-VOUCHER N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

73. 
!Cisco ONE Foundation Perpetual -

C1FPAIRK9 N/A 24 163.82 3,931.68 183.46 4,403.04 204.75 4,914.00 
Wireless I 

SWSS UPGRADES Cl Foundation 
36.0 month(s) 3,000.00 114.60 2,750.40 115.47 2,771.28 74. CON-ECMU-ClFPAIR 24 125.00 

Perpetual - Wireless 
fosco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 75. l Cl-WLC-1 24 0.00 
. L~cense (any WLC) 

76. 
Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

License PAK (any WLC) 
Cl-WLC-PAK N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

77. 
Cisco ONE Pl Device License for LF & AS 

for WLAN 
Cl-Pl-LFAS-AP-K9 N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

78. 
Cisco ONE Identity Services Engine 25 

Cl-ISE-BASE-AP N/A 24 
EndPoint Base Lie 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 . 0.00 

- 1 

79. 
Cisco ONE CMX OnPrem Base (Location 

Cl-MSE-LS-1 N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
i + Connect) -_lAP license -

80. 
Cisco ONE Energy Mgmt Perpetual Lie -

Cl-CEM-25-K9 N/A 24 
25 DO End Points 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

81. Cisco ONE StealthWatch 5 FPS Lie 1 YR Cl-LC-5-1 Y N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

82. 
Tracker PIO v03 Fnd Perpetual AIR - no 

ClFlVAIR-03 N/A 1 
delivery 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

83. 
Catalyst 9300 24-port PoE+, Network 

C9300-24P-E N/A 3 2,527.47 7,582.41 3,157.06 9,471.18 3,159.00 9,477.00 
Essentials 

84. 
SNTC-8X5XNBD Cata lyst 9300 24-port 

PoE+, Network Esse 
CON-SNT-C93002PE 36.0 month(s) 3 805.00 2,415.00 735.17 2,205.51 740.78 2,222.34 
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85. 
Cisco ONE C9300 DNA Essentials 24-

Port Term licenses 
Cl-C9300-24-DNAE-T N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

86. Cisco ONE Subscription SKU 3Y Cl-C9300-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

87. Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term Cl-ISE-BASE-T N/A 75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

88. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

89. Catalyst Stack Power Cable 30 CM CAB-SPWR-30CM N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

90. 50CM Type 1 Stacking Cable STACK-Tl-50CM N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

91. North America AC Type A Power Cable CAB-TA-NA N/A 6 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

92. 715W AC Config 1 Power Supply PWR-Cl-715WAC N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

93. CAT9300 Universal Image S9300UK9-165 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

94. 
C9300 Network Essentials, 24-port 

C9300-NW-E-24 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
license 

95. 
715W AC Config 1 Secondary Power 

PWR-Cl-715WAC/2 N/A 3 
Supply 

585.06 1,755.18 655.20 1,965.60 731.25 

96. 
Cisco ONE Essentials Term, C9300 24-

C1E1TCAT93001 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
port 

97. 
Cl Essentials Term C9300 24P 3Y - DNA, 

25 ISE Base C1E1TCAT93001-3Y 36.0 month(s) 3 320.61 961.83 400.48 1,201.44 400.73 

98. Catalyst 9300 4 x lGE Network Module C9300-NM-4G N/A 3 234.03 702.09 292.32 876.96 292.50 

99. Shipping & Handling N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

TOTAL PRICE 212,816.11 245,421.59 

• Hayes E-Government Resources only submitted a "quote" and not the actual bid proposal document and are therefore considered non-responsive and not included in this tabulation. 
** Zones' Extended price of $2,750.40 ls incorrect for line 60; unit price governs and is carried over to total price. Zones' submitted Total Price was $245,971.97. Correct amount ls $245,421.59. 
•••Total Communications' Extended price of $17,870.77 for line 2 and $2,719.20 for line 48 is incorrect; unit price governs and is carried over to total price. Submitted Total Price was $251,575.39. 

Correct amount is $251,564.41. 

Total 

Price 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

2,193.75 

0.00 

1,202.19 

877.50 

0.00 

251,564.41 
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1. 
Catalyst 9300 48-port PoE+, Network 

C9300-48P-E t /A 14 5,613.59 78,590.26 5,894.24 82,519.36 

t 
0.00 

Essentials I l t 

SNTC-8X5XNBD Catalyst 9300 48-port I 

1,364.451 2. I CON-SNT-C93004PE ' 36.0 month(s) 1 14 1,416.60 19,832.40 19,102.30 0.00 
PoE+, Ni:!twork Esse 

t 
3. Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term ICl-ISE-BASE-T N/A 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

I 
0.00 

I 
+ 

4. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
- r + 

Cisco ONE C9300 DNA Essentials 48-
5. Cl-C9300-48-DNAE-T N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

Port Term licenses 

6. Cisco ONE Subscription SKU 3Y Cl-C9300-TRK-3Y ' 36.0 month(s) 14 0.001 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
+ I _, 

' I l Cl-ISE-BASE-T 7. I Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term N/A 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

I 

8. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 36.0 month(s) 350 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

-
9. Catalyst Stack Power Cable 30 CM CAB-SPWR-30CM N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

+ 

10. 50CM Type 1 Stacking Cable STACK-Tl-50CM N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

11. North America AC Type A Power Cable CAB-TA-NA N/A 28 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

12. 715W AC Config 1 Power Supply • PWR-Cl-715WAC N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
' 

i 
13. CAT9300 Universal Image S9300UK9-165 N/A 14 0.00 0.00 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 

14. 
C9300 Network Essentials, 48-port 

C9300-NW-E-48 N/A 14 
license 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
-

15. 
715W AC Config 1 Secondary Power 

Supply 
PWR-Cl-715WAC/2 N/A 14 754.51 10,563.14 792.24 11,091.36 0.00 

16. Catalyst 9300 8 x lOGE Network Module C9300-NM-8X N/A 14 1,509.03 21,126.42 1,584.47 22,182.58 0.00 

-

17. 
Cisco ONE Essentials Term, C9300 48-

C1E1TCAT93002 N/A 14 
port 

0.00 0.00 751.04 10,514.56 0.00 

18. Cl Essentials Term C9300 48P 3Y - DNA, Cl El TCAT
93002

_
3

y 
25 ISE Base 

36.0 month(s) 14 715.29 10,014.06 751.04 10,514.56 0.00 

19. 
Cisco ONE Essential Add-On Term, 

C9300 
ClEA1TCAT93001 N/A 14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

20. 
Cl Essentials Add-On Term C9300 3Y -

25 ISE Base 
ClEAl TCAT93001-3Y 36.0 month(s) 14 51.31 718.34 53 .87 754.18 0.00 

21. 
Catalyst 9300 24-port PoE+, Network 

Essentials 
C9300-24P-E N/A 3 3,259.50 9,778.50 3,422.46 10,267.38 0.00 
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I SNTC-8X5XNBD Catalyst 9300 24-port 
136.0 month{s) 

I 
22. CON-SNT-C93002PE 3 821.92 1 2,465.76 283.73 851.19 0.00 i PoE+, Network Esse I - l 

0.001 
+ I 

2 
Cisco ONE C9300 DNA Essentials 24-

3. Cl-C9300-24-DNAE-T 1N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 -f Port Term licenses 
t 

24. Cisco ONE Subscription SKU 3Y Cl-C9300-TRK-3Y 
1
36.0 month{s) 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

o.oo l 
I 

25. !Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term Cl-ISE-BASE-T ' N/A I 75 0.001 o.oo , 0.00 
I 

0.00 

T - I j 
26. 1Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y 0.00

1 ' Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y , 36.0 month{s) 75 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 
- .I I 

27. Catalyst Stack Power Cable 30 CM CAB-SPWR-30CM 
1
N/A 3 0.00 

I 

0.00 0.00 0.00 i 0.00 

I 

l N/A 
I 

28. l 50CM Type 1 Stacking Cable I STACK-Tl-50CM 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 
I I 

29. North America AC Type A Power Cable CAB-TA-NA N/A 6 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
-

T 
30. ' 715W AC Config 1 Power Supply PWR-Cl-715WAC N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

L 
I 

1 1 t 

31. 'CAT9300 Universal Image S9300UK9-165 1N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
I 

0.00 

32 . 
C9300 Network Essentials, 24-port 

C9300-NW-E-24 N/A 3 ' 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
license t 715W AC Config 1 Secondary Power 

33. S I PWR-Cl-715WAC/2 N/A 3 754.51 2,263.53 792.24 2,376.72 I 0.00 t upp y j - 1 r 

' 
34. Catalyst 9300 8 x lOGE Network Module C9300-NM-8X N/A 3 1,509.031 4,527.09 1,584.47 4,753.41 0.00 

l 
35. 

Cisco ONE Essentials Term, C9300 24-
C1E1TCAT93001 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

po_!!_ I 
- ,_ - ,. 

Cl Essentials Term C9300 24P 3Y - DNA, I 
36. 

25 ISE Base C1E1TCAT93001-3Y 36.0 month{s) 3 413.48 1,240.44 434.15 1,302.45 I 0.00 

37. Cisco ISE Device Admin License L-ISE-TACACS= N/A 1 2,414.45 2,414.45 2,535.16 2,535.16 I 0.00 
- - l 

38. 
Cisco Identity Services Engine 500 

L-ISE-BSE-SOO= N/A 1 1,353.70 1,353.70 1,426.03 1,426.03 0.00 
EndPoint Base License 

39. 
Cisco ISE 100 Endpoint Plus Subscription 

1 N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 L-ISE-PLS-S-100= 
License 

40. Cisco ISE 3-Yr 100 Endpoint Plus License ISE-PLS-3YR-100 36.0 month{s) 1 995.96 995.96 1,045.76 1,045.76 0.00 
I 

41. 
Cisco ISE 100 Endpoint Apex 

Subscription License 
L-ISE-APX-S-100= N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

42. 
Cisco ISE 3-Yr 100 Endpoint Apex 

ISE-APX-3YR-100 36.0 month{s) 1 754.51 754.51 792.24 792.24 0.00 
License 
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service Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total 

Item DESCRIPTION Part Number Duration QTY Price Price Price Price Price Price 

** UNIT PRICES LEFT BLANK ARE DEEMED NO BID BY THE VENDOR ** 
!Cisco Identity Services Engine VM I I I 

43. R-ISE-VM-K9= N/A I 3 3,61S.63 10,846.89 1 3,796.40 11,389.20 0.00 
{eDelivery) 

-l t 
SWSS UPGRADES Cisco Identity Services I I I 

44. I CON-ECMU-ISEVM 136.0 month{s) 3 2,896.0S ' 8,688.lS 2,790.11 , 8,370.33 1 0.00 
Engin~ VM_jeDelivery) _ . 

·- t lOGBASE-LR SFP Module, Enterprise- l SFP-lOG-LR-S= 
I 

I 4S. N/A 10 1,146.87 , 11,468.70 1 1,204.2l 12,042.00 0.00 
Class - - ' I 
lOGBASE-SR SFP Module, Enterprise- I 

46. SFP-lOG-SR-S= IN/A 8 392.34 3,138.72 1 411.97 : 3,29S.76 1 0.00 
Class ' J __ -- -- i 
802 .llac W2 AP w/CA; 4x4:3; Int Ant; I 

47. AIR-AP28021-B-K9 /N/A 24 781.68 18,760321 820.76 19,698.24 0.00 
2xGbE B I -t 

SNTC-8XSXNBD 802.llac W2 AP w/CA; ' 
48 . . CON-SNT-AIRAPIKB 36.0 month{s) ' 24 12S.70 3,016.80 121.07 2,90S.68 0.00 

fc;x4 :3; Int Ant; 2xG 
' 

eiling Grid Clip for Aironet APs -
AIR-AP-T-RAIL-R N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 49. ~ Recessed Mount {D!'iault) 

~02.lln AP Low Profile Mounting ' so. I AIR-AP-BRACKET-1 N/A I 24 0.00 0.00 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 
rac~et {DefauJ!) _ 

l T t- J. 

Sl. 
;Cisco Aironet 2800 Series CAPWAP 1 SW2802-CAPWAP-K9 1N/A 0.00 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 24 0.00 

+ softw_ci re lmag_e I 
t 1 

S2 . Cisco ONE - 3S04 Wireless Controller Cl-AIR-CT3504-K9 IN/A ' 3 3,018.06 9,0S4.18 3,168.9S 9,S06.8S 0.00 
I 

J I 

S3 . 
,SNTC-8XSXNBD Cisco ONE - 3S04 

CON-SNT-C19AIRKC 36.0 month{s) 3 1,S71.31 4,713.93 1,S12.76 4,S38.28 0.00 
Wireless Controller 

r • 
S4. AC Power Cord, Type CS, US, Canada CAB-AC-CS N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

1 Cis~o -3S04 Wireless Controller DTLS 
-l --- + - ,_ 

I 

SS. LIC-CT3S04-DTLS-K9 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 1 0.00 1 0.00 0.00 
I License 

- l 

S6. 
Cisco 3S04 Wireless Controller SW Rel. 

N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

~ -

AIR-CT3S04-SW-8.S 3 
I 

0.00 
I 

-t - - 1-
Cisco 3S04 Wireless Controller Power 

,N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 S7. PWR-llSW-AC 3 0.00 
S_l:lpply 

r 
3S04 Wireless Controller Rack Mount ' 

S8. Al R-CT3S04-RM NT N/A 3 13S.81 407.43 142.60 427.80 I 0.00 
~!_ClY 

! 
-

S9. 
,Cisco ONE Foundation Perpetual -

C1FPAIRK9 N/A 3 211.26 633.78 • 221.83 66S.49 I 0.00 
Wireless I 

SWSS UPGRADES Cl Foundation ! 
0.00 60. CON-ECMU-ClFPAIR 36.0 month{s) 3 128.12 384.36 123.49 370.47 

Perpetual - Wireless -Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 
N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 61. Cl-WLC-1 3 0.00 

License {any WLC) . 
62. 

Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

License PAK {any WLC) 
Cl-WLC-PAK N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

63. 
Cisco ONE Pl Device License for LF & AS 

for WLAN 
Cl-Pl-LFAS-AP-K9 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
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:)erv1ce Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total 

Item DESCRIPTION Part Number Duration QTY Price Price Price Price Price Price 

** UNIT PRICES LEFT BLANK ARE DEEMED NO BID BY THE VENDOR ** 

~"'ONE ldeomv s'"'"' '"''"' 2s N/A 0.00 · 0.00 0.00 0.00 64. d Cl-ISE-BASE-AP 3 0.00 I 
n Point Base Lie j t 

o.oo l 
-

6 
sco ONE CMX OnPrem Base (Location . 

5. !Cl-MSE-LS-1 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
Connect) - lAP license t lCisc~ ONE Energy Mgmt Perpetual Lie - 1 

66" I 25 DO End Points Cl-CEM-25-K9 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 l 0.00 

I 
67. Cisco ONE StealthWatch 5 FPS Lie 1 YR Cl-LC-5-lY N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 ' 0.00 

- - - j 
68. 

Tracker PIO v03 Fnd Perpetual AIR - no 
ClFl VAIR-03 N/A 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

delivery I 

' Cisco ONE Access - Wireless - CHOOSE I 
69. Cl-AIR-K9 N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

' 
0.00 

ONLY QTY 1 HERE 
>----

~ -· l 
70. l SWSS UPGRADES Cisco ONE - Wireless 36.0 month(s) 

I 
CON -ECMU-ClAIRK 1 0.00 ' 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

I 
71. Cisco ONE MSE License PAK I Cl-MSE-PAK N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 

I ,_ 

72. Tracker Eligibility SKU for DNA Offers DNA-VOUCHER N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
I 

0.00 ! 

- j. 

73 . 
Cisco ONE Foundation Perpetual -

C1FPAIRK9 N/A 24 211.26 5,070.24 221.83 5,323.92 I 0.00 
Wireless t SWSS UPGRADES Cl Foundation 

74. CON-ECMU-ClFPAIR 36.0 month(s) 24 128.12 3,074.88 123.49 2,963.76 0.00 
Perpetual - Wireless 

t 75. 
Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

N/A Cl-WLC-1 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
+License (any WLC) I 

+ 

76. 
Cisco ONE Wireless LAN Controller AP 

N/A 
License PAK (any WLC) 

Cl-WLC-PAK 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

t 

77. 
Cisco ONE Pl Device License for LF & AS 

N/A Cl-Pl -LFAS-AP-K9 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
forWLAN -- - t 

78. 
Cisco ONE Identity Services Engine 25 

Cl-ISE-BASE-AP N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
EndPoint Base Lie 

: 

79. 
Cisco ONE CMX OnPrem Base (Location 

N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 I 0.00 Cl-MSE-LS-1 
+Connect) - lAP license _ 

i 

80. 
Cisco ONE Energy Mgmt Perpetual Lie -

25 DO End Points 
Cl-CEM-25-K9 N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

81. Cisco ONE StealthWatch 5 FPS Lie 1 YR Cl-LC-5-1 Y N/A 24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

82. 
Tracker PIO v03 Fnd Perpetual AIR - no 

ClFlVAIR-03 N/A 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
delivery 

+ 

83. 
Catalyst 9300 24-port PoE+, Network 

Essentials 
C9300-24P-E N/A 3 3,259.50 9,778.50 3,422.46 10,267.38 0.00 

84. 
SNTC-8X5XNBD Catalyst 9300 24-port 

PoE+, Network Esse 
CON-SNT-C93002PE 36.0 month(s) 3 821.92 2,465.76 791.11 2,373.33 0.00 
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Item DESCRIPTION Part Number 

85. 
Cisco ONE C9300 DNA Essentials 24-

Cl-C9300-24-DNAE-T 
Port Term licenses 

86. Cisco ONE Subscription SKU 3Y Cl-C9300-TRK-3Y 

87. Cisco ONE ISE BASE License Term Cl-ISE-BASE-T 

88. Cisco ONE Subscription ISE BASE 3Y Cl-ISE-BASE-TRK-3Y 

89. Catalyst Stack Power Cable 30 CM CAB-SPWR-30CM 

90. 50CM Type 1 Stacking Cable STACK-Tl-50CM 

91. North America AC Type A Power Cable CAB-TA-NA 

92. 715W AC Config 1 Power Supply PWR-Cl-715WAC 

93. CAT9300 Universal Image S9300UK9-165 

94. 
C9300 Network Essentials, 24-port 

C9300-NW-E-24 
license 

95. 
715W AC Config 1 Secondary Power 

PWR-Cl-715WAC/2 
Supply 

96. 
Cisco ONE Essentials Term, C9300 24-

ClElTCAT93001 
port 

97. 
Cl Essentials Term C9300 24P 3Y - DNA, 

25 ISE Base C1E1TCAT93001-3Y 

98. Catalyst 9300 4 x lGE Network Module C9300-NM-4G 

99. Shipping & Handling 

, 
IO!d.0/17 

Approved By. 

Dwight E. Brock 

Clerk of the Circuit Court 

5erv1ce 
Duration QTY 

N/A 3 

36.0 month(s) 3 

N/A 75 

36.0 month(s) 75 

N/A 3 

N/A 3 

N/A 6 

N/A 3 

N/A 3 

N/A 3 

N/A 3 

N/A 3 

36.0 month(s) 3 

N/A 3 

N/A 1 

TOTAL PRICE 

Date 

/o 
Date 

Bidder 4 Bidder 5 Bidder 6 

Adora ma Troxell Bidder Name 

Unit l Total Unit 

I 
Total Unit 

I 
Total 

Price Price Price Price Price Price 

** UNIT PRICES LEFT BLANK ARE DEEMED NO BID BY THE VENDOR** 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
; 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

t 
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

' 
0.00 

I 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

754.51 2,263.53 792.24 2,376.72 0.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

413.48 1,240.44 434.15 1,302.45 0.00 

301.81 905.43 316.89 950.67 0.00 
I 

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 

262,550.60 280,797.57 0.00 




